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These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
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appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume
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this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
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appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume
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this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
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These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
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way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
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DESIGNED BY RAQUEL M JACKSON

DRAWN BY REETI NARAYAN 

BAND / CATWALK

DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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DESIGNED BY RAQUEL M JACKSON

DRAWN BY REETI NARAYAN 
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DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson

ASSOCIATE ARTISTIC DIRECTOR
JAMES DONADIO
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DATE: 10-5-2021

DESIGNED BY RAQUEL M JACKSON

DRAWN BY REETI NARAYAN 

PIANO PLATFORM

DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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DESIGNED BY RAQUEL M JACKSON

DRAWN BY REETI NARAYAN 

BIRDS  EYE VIEW

DIRECTED BY RENEE CLARK

These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson
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These drawings represent visual concept and construction suggestions
only. It is not the designer's responsibility to determine structural
appropriateness of the design and the designer does not assume

responsibility for improper engineering, construction, handing or use of
this scenery.

This scenic design and these drawings are the sole property of Raquel
M Jackson. By viewing these drawings you agree that you will not copy,
duplicate, transfer or by any other means divulge their constants. In no

way will you compromise the ownership rights of Raquel M Jackson

ASSOCIATE ARTISTIC DIRECTOR
JAMES DONADIO 12

OF 12


